
TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

Town Hall ∙ 100 Main Street Phone: (631) 351-3177

Huntington, NY 11743-6991 Fax: (631) 351-2833

http://HuntingtonNY.gov

AWARD:

BID NO. TOH 16-11-067

BID OPENED:  11/10/16

CATEGORY #19:  TRAFFIC AND ROAD SUPPLIES, EQUIPMENT AND RELATED SERVICES

#3117 Pelkowski Precast Corp. Tel:  631-269-5727

294A Old Northport Road Fax:  631-269-2100

Kings Park, NY 11754 teamworkyard@gmail.com

Attn:  Robert Pelkowski, Vice President

Lori E. Finger, CPPB                                     For additional information contact                                              Denise Gallo

Director of Purchasing                                     purchasing@huntingtonny.gov                                        Purchasing Agent

PRECAST RINGS, DOMES AND COVERS (REBID)

CONTRACT PERIOD:  11/29/16 TO AND INCLUDING 10/31/17

AWARDEES:

       Pursuant to New York General Municipal Law §103(16), the contract awarded hereby shall be made available to other New York 

State governmental entities and, therefore, any New York State officer, board or agency of a political subdivision or of any district 

therein authorized to make purchases of apparatus, materials, equipment or supplies, or to contract for services related to the 

installation, maintenance, or repair of apparatus, materials, equipment or supplies, may make such purchases, or may contract for 

such services through the use of this contract.  Said entities using this contract shall be wholly responsible for the determination that 

the contract meets their requirements and for the issuance of said contract and shall be solely responsible for the payment of any and 

all debts and claims that arise thereunder.  

ALL PRICES ARE FOB TOWN OF HUNTINGTON
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

Price

ITEM DIAMETER

1 6'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$50.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$61.00

2 8'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$50.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$61.00

3 10'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$74.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$92.00

4 12'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$94.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$110.00

ITEM DIAMETER

5 4'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$39.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$58.00

6 6'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$44.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$60.00

7 8'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$49.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$62.00

8 10'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$74.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$92.00

SANITARY DRAIN RINGS:  Shall be 4'-0", 6'-0", 8'-0" and 10'-0" outside diameter and shall be 

of variable heights from 2'-0" to 6'-0".  The wall thickness shall be minimum 4".  Welded wire 

fabric reinforment shall be 6" x 12", 6 ga. horizontal, 8 ga. vertical.  Drain openings shall be 

spaced evenly all around the ring and shall yield a minimum of 75 sq. inches per foot of height for 

4'-0" rings; 175 sq. inches for 6'-0" rings; 200 sq. inches for 8'-0" rings, 250 sq. inches for 10'-0" 

rings.  The drain opening angle for be 20 or less.

STORM DRAIN RINGS:  Shall be 6'-0", 8'-0", 10'-0" and 12'-0" outside diameter and shall be of 

variable heights fro 2'-0" to 6'-0".  The wall thickness shall be minimum 4".  Welded wire fabric 

reinforcement shall be 6" x 12" 6 ga. Horizontal, 8 ga. vertical.  Use double mesh for 12'-0" rings.  

drain opening shall be spaced evenly all around the ring and shall yield a minimum of 20 sq. 

inches per foot of height for 6'-0" rings; 30 sq. inches for 8'-0" rings; 35 sq. inches for 10'-0"; 50 sq. 

inches for 12'-0".  The drain opening angle shall be 14 degrees or less.  All drain openings shall be 

clear and unobstructed.  All excess concrete flashing shall be removed from drain openings prior to 

delivery to the Town.

DESCRIPTION
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

ITEM DIAMETER

9 4'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$63.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$75.00

10 6'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$68.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$79.00

11 8'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$59.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$80.00

12 10'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$84.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$106.00

13 12'-0"

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$114.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$138.00

ITEM DIAMETER

14 6'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$169.00

Delivered Price Each
$194.00

15 8'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$189.00

Delivered Price Each
$214.00

16 10'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$319.00

Delivered Price Each
$344.00

17 12'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$644.00

Delivered Price Each
$666.00

SOLID WALL RINGS; WALL PREFORMED OPENINGS:  Shall be 4'-0", 6'-0", 8'-0", 10'-0" 

and 12'-0" outside diameter and shall be of variable heights from 2'-0" to 6'-0".  The wall thickness 

shall be minimum 4".  Welded wire fabric reinforcement shall be 6" x 12", 6 ga. horizontal, 8 ga. 

vertical.  Use double mesh for 12'-0" rings.

SOLID WALL DOMES:  Shall be truncated cones having outside diameters at the bottom of 6'-

0", 8'-0", 10'-0" and 12'-0".  The approximate height for the 6'-0" dome is 2'-3"; 8'-0" dome is 2'-9"; 

10'-0" dome is 3'-8"; 12'-0" dome is 3'-6" with a built-in top slab.  The wall thickness shall be a 

minimum 4".  Reinforcing shall be twelve (12) #2 vertical, #3 hoops top and bottom (#4 at bottom 

of 10'-0" dome and #4 at top and #5 at bottom or 12'-0" dome).  Knockout blanks shall be provided 

at 90 apart.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

ITEM DIAMETER AND THICKNESS

MINIMUM 

REINFORCEMENT

18 4'-0" - 6" #4 @ 6" on center both 

ways

Picked Up Price Each $135.00

Delivered Price Each $145.00

19 6'-0" - 6" #4 @ 6" o.c. b.w.

Picked Up Price Each
$157.00

Delivered Price Each
$167.00

20 8'-0" - 8" #4 @ 4" o.c. b.w.

Picked Up Price Each
$224.00

Delivered Price Each
$248.00

21 10'-0" - 8" #5 @ 6" o.c. b.w.

Picked Up Price Each $379.00

Delivered Price Each $400.00

22 12'-0" - 1'-8" Shall dome

#4 Top Loop

#5 Bottom Loop

#5 @ 6" o.c. b.w.  in slab

Picked Up Price Each
$578.00

Delivered Price Each
$600.00

ITEM DIAMETER AND THICKNESS

MINIMUM 

REINFORCEMENT

23 4'-0" - 6" 4 x 4/10 & 10 WWF

Picked Up Price Each
$135.00

Delivered Price Each
$145.00

24 6'-0" - 6" 4 x 4/10 & 10 WWF

Picked Up Price Each
$156.00

Delivered Price Each
$166.00

25 8'-0" - 6" #4 @ 12" o.c. b.w.

Picked Up Price Each
$208.00

Delivered Price Each
$226.00

26 10'-0" - 6" #4 @ 12" o.c. b.w.

Picked Up Price Each
$358.00

Delivered Price Each
$380.00

27 12'-0" - 6" #4 @ 12" o.c. b.w.

Picked Up Price Each
$688.00

Delivered Price Each
$710.00

TOP SLABS:  Shall be as follows:

BOTTOM SLABS:  Shall be as follows:
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

ITEM DIAMETER

28 8'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$178.00

Delivered Price Each
$200.00

29 10'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$220.00

Delivered Price Each
$248.00

ITEM HEIGHT

30 1'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$38.00

Delivered Price Each
$50.00

31 1'-4"

Picked Up Price Each
NO BID

Delivered Price Each
NO BID

32 2'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$68.00

Delivered Price Each
$88.00

33 3'-0"

Picked Up Price Each
$115.00

Delivered Price Each
$115.00

ITEM DIAMETER

34 30"

Picked Up Price Each
$29.00

Delivered Price Each
$48.00

ITEM

35
Picked Up Price Each

$470.00

Delivered Price Each
$480.00

FOOTINGS:  Shall be 8'-0" and 10'-0" outside diameter, 10" wide x 8" deep.  Minimum 

reinforcing shall be 2 I ops of #4 rebars.  

EXTENSIONS:  Shall be 24" I.D., 1'-0", 2'-0" or 3'-0" in height, with minimum 3" wall thickness.  

Minimum reinforcing shall have 4 x 4/10 & 10 WWF. 

COVERS:  Shall be 30" diameter and 4" thick.  Minimum reinforcing shall 4 x 4/10 & 10 WWF.

900 GALLON SEPTIC TANK:  Shall be either circular or rectangular and include all necessary 

parts to make up a complete tank as required by the Suffolk County Health Department
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

ITEM* DESCRIPTION

36 2'-2" wall height  

Picked Up Price
$600.00

Delivered Price
$630.00

37 2'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$648.00

Delivered Price
$675.00

38 3'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$700.00

Delivered Price
$725.00

39 3'-6" wall height 

Picked Up Price
$740.00

Delivered Price
$770.00

40 4'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$790.00

Delivered Price
$820.00

41 4'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$840.00

Delivered Price
$860.00

42 5'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$880.00

Delivered Price
$900.00

43 5'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$950.00

Delivered Price
$980.00

44 6'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,020.00

Delivered Price
$1,045.00

45 6'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,090.00

Delivered Price
$1,115.00

46 7'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,150.00

Delivered Price
$1,180.00

4'0" I.D. MANHOLES:  Shall be a complete manhole assembly, consisting of necessary components such 

as:  bottom slab, base section, riser section, cone and top slab.  Included shall be preformed pipe openings as 

required.  Refer to attached drawings and specifications.  Award shall be made to lowest responsible bidder 

for each wall height at yard price and for each wall height at delivered price.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

47 7'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,225.00

Delivered Price
$1,250.00

48 8'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,290.00

Delivered Price
$1,320.00

49 8'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,360.00

Delivered Price
$1,390.00

50 9'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,430.00

Delivered Price
$1,455.00

51 9'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,490.00

Delivered Price
$1,520.00

52 10'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,565.00

Delivered Price
$1,590.00

53 10'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,630.00

Delivered Price
$1,660.00

54 11'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,700.00

Delivered Price
$1,730.00

55 11'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,770.00

Delivered Price
$1,800.00

56 12'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,840.00

Delivered Price
$1,860.00

* Complete manhole with various wall heights.

** Wall height is defined as:  The distance between the top of the bottom slab and the bottom 

of the top slab.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

ITEM* DESCRIPTION

57 2'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$604.00

Delivered Price
$630.00

58 2'-6" wall height 

Picked Up Price
$650.00

Delivered Price
$675.00

59 3'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$700.00

Delivered Price
$720.00

60 3'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$740.00

Delivered Price
$770.00

61 4'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$790.00

Delivered Price
$820.00

62 4'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$840.00

Delivered Price
$865.00

63 5'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$880.00

Delivered Price
$910.00

64 5'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$950.00

Delivered Price
$980.00

65 6'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,020.00

Delivered Price
$1,050.00

66 6'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,090.00

Delivered Price
$1,115.00

67 7'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,150.00

Delivered Price
$1,180.00

4'-0" x 4'-0" MANHOLES:  Shall be in complete manhole assembly, consisting of necessary 

components such as bottom slab, riser section, and top slab.  Included shall be preformed 

pipe openings as required.  Defer to attached drawing and specifications.  Award shall be 

made to lowest responsible bidder for each wall height at yard price and for each wall height 

at delivered price.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

68 7'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,225.00

Delivered Price
$1,250.00

69 8'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,290.00

Delivered Price
$1,320.00

70 8'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,360.00

Delivered Price
$1,390.00

71 9'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,430.00

Delivered Price
$1,450.00

72 9'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,620.00

Delivered Price
$1,640.00

73 10'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,700.00

Delivered Price
$1,730.00

74 10'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,770.00

Delivered Price
$1,800.00

75 11'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,840.00

Delivered Price
$1,860.00

76 11'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,900.00

Delivered Price
$1,930.00

77 12'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,975.00

Delivered Price
$2,000.00

* Complete manhole with various wall heights.

** Wall height is defined as:  The distance between the top of the bottom slab and the bottom 

of the top slab.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

78 2'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,320.00

Delivered Price
$1,375.00

79 2'-6" wall height 

Picked Up Price
$1,430.00

Delivered Price
$1,480.00

80 3'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,600.00

Delivered Price
$1,625.00

81 3'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,735.00

Delivered Price
$1,760.00

82 4'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,760.00

Delivered Price
$1,820.00

83 4'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,790.00

Delivered Price
$1,845.00

84 5'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,930.00

Delivered Price
$1,955.00

85 5'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,985.00

Delivered Price
$2,040.00

86 6'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,010.00

Delivered Price
$2,065.00

87 6'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,065.00

Delivered Price
$2,120.00

88 7'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,090.00

Delivered Price
$2,150.00

5'-0" x 5'-0" MANHOLES:  Shall be in complete manhole assembly, consisting of necessary 

components such as bottom slab, riser section, and top slab.  Included shall be preformed pipe 

openings as required.  Defer to attached drawing specifications.  Award shall be made to lowest 

responsible bidder for each wall height at yard price and for each wall height at delivered price.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

89 7'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,175.00

Delivered Price
$2,200.00

90 8'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,200.00

Delivered Price
$2,230.00

91 8'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,230.00

Delivered Price
$2,260.00

92 9'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,340.00

Delivered Price
$2,395.00

93 9'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,370.00

Delivered Price
$2,480.00

94 10'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,480.00

Delivered Price
$2,535.00

95 10'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,560.00

Delivered Price
$2,645.00

96 11'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,675.00

Delivered Price
$2,700.00

97 11'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,780.00

Delivered Price
$2,840.00

98 12'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,865.00

Delivered Price
$2,920.00

* Complete manhole with various wall heights.

** Wall height is defined as:  The distance between the top of the bottom slab and the bottom 

of the top slab.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

99 2'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,650.00

Delivered Price
$1,700.00

100 2'-6" wall height 

Picked Up Price
$1,680.00

Delivered Price
$1,735.00

101 3'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,760.00

Delivered Price
$1,875.00

102 3'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,845.00

Delivered Price
$1,955.00

103 4'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,900.00

Delivered Price
$2,000.00

104 4'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,985.00

Delivered Price
$2,095.00

105 5'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,120.00

Delivered Price
$2,175.00

106 5'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$1,980.00

Delivered Price
$2,260.00

107 6'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,370.00

Delivered Price
$2,425.00

108 6'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,425.00

Delivered Price
$2,480.00

109 7'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,530.00

Delivered Price
$2,590.00

6'-0" x 6'-0" MANHOLES:  Shall be in complete manhole assembly, consisting of necessary 

components such as bottom slab, riser section, and top slab.  Included shall be preformed pipe 

openings as required.  Defer to attached drawing specifications.  Award shall be made to lowest 

responsible bidder for each wall height at yard price and for each wall height at delivered price.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

110 7'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,640.00

Delivered Price
$2,700.00

111 8'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,750.00

Delivered Price
$2,800.00

112 8'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,865.00

Delivered Price
$2,920.00

113 9'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$2,975.00

Delivered Price
$3,030.00

114 9'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$3,085.00

Delivered Price
$3,140.00

115 10'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$3,195.00

Delivered Price
$3,550.00

116 10'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$3,305.00

Delivered Price
$3,360.00

117 11'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$3,390.00

Delivered Price
$3,445.00

118 11'-6" wall height

Picked Up Price
$3,525.00

Delivered Price
$3,580.00

119 12'-0" wall height

Picked Up Price
$3,625.00

Delivered Price
$3,690.00

* Complete manhole with various wall heights.

** Wall height is defined as:  The distance between the top of the bottom slab and the bottom 

of the top slab.
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

ITEM

120** 8'-0" Diameter Solid Wall Dome (Item #15)

Picked Up Price Each
$178.00

Delivered Price Each
$215.00

121** 8'-0" Diameter Storm Drain (Item #2)

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$48.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$60.00

ITEM

122** 8'-0" Diameter x 8" Top (Item #20)

Picked Up Price Each
$220.00

Delivered Price Each
$250.00

123**  8'-0" Diameter Storm Drain Ring (Item #2)

Picked Up Price/Vert.Ft.
$48.00

Delivered Price/Vert.Ft.
$60.00

124** 10'-0" Diameter Solid Wall Dome (Item #16)

Picked Up Price Each
$315.00

Delivered Price Each
$340.00

125** 10'-0" Diameter Storm Drain Ring (Item #3) 

Picked Up Price/Vert. Ft.
$74.00

Delivered Price/Vert. Ft.
$90.00

ITEM COMPONENTS

126**
10'-0" Diameter x 8" Top (Item #21)

Picked Up Price Each
$378.00

Delivered Price Each
$415.00

127** 10'-0" Diameter Storm Drain Ring  (Item #3)

Picked Up Price /Vert.Ft.
NO BID

Delivered Price /Vert.Ft.
NO BID

ITEM

128
Picked Up Price Each

$715.00

Delivered Price Each
$740.00

2'-6" x 4'-0" CATCH BASIN  (As per enclosed drawing)

8'-0" DIAMETER STORM LEACHING POOL WITH 8" THICK TRAFFIC TOP SLAB 

AN VARIABLE HEIGHT OF STORM DRAIN RINGS:  

10'-0" DIAMETER STORM LEACHING POOL WITH SOLID WALL DOME TOP AND 

VARIABLE HEIGHT OF STORM DRAIN RINGS:  10'-0" Diameter Solid Wall Dome (Item 

#16)

10'-0" DIAMETER STORM LEACHING POOL WITH 8" THICK TRAFFIC TOP SLAB 

AND VARIABLE HEIGHT OF STORM DRAIN RINGS:

8'-0" DIAMETER STORM LEACHING POOL WITH SOLID WALL DOME TOP AND 

VARIABLE HEIGHT OF STORM DRAIN RINGS:  
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TOH 16-10-067 TOWN OF HUNTINGTON

PriceDESCRIPTION

ITEM

129
Picked Up Price Each

NO BID

Delivered Price Each
NO BID

ITEM

130
Picked Up Price Each

NO BID

Delivered Price Each
NO BID

YARD LOCATION:  294A Old Northport Rd.

                                   Kings Park, NY 11754

** TO BE AWARDED AS A GROUP.

TYPE "D" LEACHING CATCH BASIN (As per enclosed drawing)

TYPE "DX" LEACHING CATCH BASIN (As per enclosed drawing)
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